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SUMMARY OF THE EVALUATED BID FOR SUPPLY OF CLEAN PETROLEUM PRODUCTS IN THE MONTH OF APRIL 

2020 

Discharge point C1 

SPM 

C2 

SPM 

C1 

KOJ1 

C2 

KOJ1 

C3 

KOJ1 

C 

KOJ1 

COMBI CARGO, TANGA & MTWARA 

Product Gasoil Gasoil Mogas Mogas Mogas Jet A-1&IK  Gasoil Mogas 

Quantity in MT 86,351 86,352 38,621 38,596 38,093 24,326  20,150 16,750 

Price basis Average European Marketscan Platt’s Quotation for the month of March, 2020 (01st March, 2020 to 31st March, 2020); under the 

quote ‘Mean Fob Arab Gulf Gasoil 0.005% S’ 

Bidders DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

Weighted 

Average 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

DAP 

Premium 

Usd/Mt 

 

ADDAX ENERGY SA 32.900 

 

35.690 

 

24.170 

 

23.000 

 

22.170 

 

61.970 

 

45.090 

 

45.090 

 

45.090 

 

SAHARA ENERGY 

RESOURCES LIMITED 

35.950 

 

36.690 

 

37.840 

 

36.840 

 

34.840 

 

55.600 

 

52.256 

 

51.180 

 

53.550 

 

TRAFIGURA PTE 

LIMITED 

33.340 

 

35.190 

 

27.770 

 

27.770 

 

27.770 

 

NO BID 

 

NO BID NO BID NO BID 

TOTSA TOTAL OIL 

TRADING SA 

34.880 

 

35.860 

 

34.330 

 

33.200 

 

31.710 

 

68.000 

 

NO BID NO BID NO BID 

GALANA PETROLEUM 

LTD 

35.750 

 

37.150 

 

29.285 

 

      

VITOL BAHRAIN EC 38.820 

 

39.470 

 

44.300 

 

43.300 

 

39.300 

 

75.490 

 

NO BID NO BID NO BID 

GBP TANZANIA 

LIMITED 

      41.769 

 

49.940 

 

31.940 

 

 

     Key Note:                   Lowest Premium 
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SUMMARY OF THE WINNERS FOR SUPPLY OF CLEAN PETROLEUM PRODUCTS IN THE MONTH 

OF APRIL 2020 

 

Tender Number Winner Delivery date range 

PBPA/CPP/AGO/C1-SPM/04/2020 ADDAX ENERGY SA 01-03 April 2020 

PBPA/CPP/AGO/C2-SPM/04/2020 TRAFIGURA PTE LIMITED 16-18 April 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C1-KOJ1/04/2020   ADDAX ENERGY SA 04-06 April 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C2-KOJ1/04/2020 ADDAX ENERGY SA 10-12 April 2020 

PBPA/CPP/PMS/C3-KOJ1/04/2020 ADDAX ENERGY SA 26-28 April 2020 

PBPA/CPP/JETA-1&IK/C-KOJ1/04/2020 SAHARA ENERGY RESOURCES LIMITED 20-22 April 2020 

PBPA/CPP/COMBI/TANGA&MTWARA/04/2020 GBP TANZANIA LIMITED 18-20 April 2020 

 

 


